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The sectoral composition of the Indian economy has undergone a significant 
structural shift over the years. From a primary agro-based economy during 
the early years of planning, the Indian economy has emerged as predominant 
in the services sector during the last couple of decades. The shift in the 
composition is likely to cause substantial changes in production and demand, 
and the linkages among various sectors of the economy. This paper seeks to 
address the reasons for this growth and consequent ‘structural change’ in the 
economy during the period 1983-1984 to 2003-2004, using I-O Structural 
Decomposition Analysis. 

 
I Introduction 
 
The sectoral composition of the Indian economy has undergone a significant 
structural shift over the years. It is perhaps best exemplified in terms of changes 
in the shares of GDP contributed by agriculture, industry and service sectors. 
From a primary agro-based economy during the early years of planning, the 
economy has emerged as predominant in the services sector during the last 
couple of decades. The shift in composition is likely to cause substantial changes 
in production and demand, and the linkages among various sectors in turn have 
significant implications for the overall growth and the process of development in 
the economy. With this fact in mind, this paper seeks to address the reasons for 
this ‘service-led’ growth and consequent ‘structural change’ in the economy 
during the period 1983-1984 to 2003-2004 and to highlight its implications. 
 The structural relationship among the sectors in an economy is examined in 
various ways. Perhaps the most widely used one is based on Input-Output (IO) 
tables, which provide valuable insights into the interdependence of various 
sectors in an economy. A change in sectoral composition and the reasons for it 
can be explained by the process of Structural Decomposition Analysis (SDA). 
Questions may be asked whether service-led growth and structural change in the 


